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Abstract

Scientists around the world are attempting to provide a complete theory of the fundamental 
forces, which should include quantum gravity.  As yet, no one has completed the assignment. 
What is lacking is the basic understanding that our universe literally blinks, off and on, more 
than 1 trillion times each second.  Just before blinking off each cycle, the gravitational force 
reduces to zero, making an easy explanation for quantum gravity.

This short technical paper presents an alternate mathematical approach for determining the 
blinking frequency of our universe. The source for this alternate idea comes from an email 
sent to this author in May 2015. The source author prefers to remain anonymous.

Basically, Let's think about the fundamental unit of the universe as a classical entity. The 
energy of such a classical entity, using the equipartition theorem, translates the number of 
degrees of freedom into "units" of k_B*T (where T is the temperature and k_B is the well-
known Boltzmann constant). In this way, we find that the fundamental energy is 3*k_B*T (6 
d.o.f.).

 
We use a foundational temperature, consistent with the anthropic principle, of the freezing
point (and melting point) of the essential object for existence--water. Using this temperature,
we  obtain  a  fundamental  energy  of  ~70.6  meV.  Calculation  is  as  follows:  70.6  meV  /
(\hbar \pi^4) = 1.1 THz. Note that the \pi^4 in general is \pi^D, where D is the number of
spacetime dimensions in  existence. Each reader  must  comprehend that  our  universe  is
literally blinking off and on, at 1.1 trillion times every second (THz).
 
For those unconvinced that our universe is blinking, please read “The First Periodic Table
for  Elementary  Particles,”  or  “1024  Elementary  Particles”  which  provides  compelling
mathematical evidence.
 
Also see youtube:
Colonel  Philip  Corso,  THE  DAY  AFTER  ROSWELL;  author  comments  on  the  Army's
investigation  of  the  1947  Roswell  vehicle;  "We were  never  able  to  figure  out  how the
propulsion system works... We only know it has something to do with blinking." [1]



Introduction

As explained in previous papers, in our terms, the universe blinks off and on at a very high 
frequency.[2] Due to this blinking, there is no passage of time. We will call this the Lighthouse 
Frequency, or the natural resonant frequency of our universe.  We will find that the 
gravitational force constantly varies between zero and a maximum value, while also retaining 
its time-averaged value of 9.81 m/sec2

 

 

Background
 
 
Everything in a physical universe has a natural, resonant frequency – including the universe
itself. That frequency is approximately 1 THz and can be utilized as a carrier wave.
 
This can be called a vibration, a blinking, or a frequency, but perhaps a better explanation,
in our terms - the entire physical universe is newly constructed and then collapses to a
single point at approximately 1 trillion times each second, IN OUR TERMS (this must be
emphasized). At the moment of collapse, there is no distance between galaxies - instant
communication and instant travel are possible. (In larger terms, all of time is simultaneous,
and there is no blinking.)
 
This resonant frequency is named the "Lighthouse Frequency."
 
 



Figure 1.  The four fundamental forces are related by phase angle, such that when gravity
and the electromagnetic force are near zero (sin 180), then the strong force and weak force
are at their largest value.  The four fundamental forces are constantly varying.

Technical

The author of this alternate mathematical approach is at a major university in California and 
prefers to remain anonymous. I initially provided my technical paper to him, and this was his 
answer/comments in return. He provided this alternate solution via email in May 2015. A 
summary of his email follows:

Let's think about the fundamental unit of the universe as a classical entity. The energy of such
a classical entity, using the equipartition theorem, translates the number of degrees of 
freedom into "units" of k_B*T (where T is the temperature and k_B is the well-known 
Boltzmann constant). In this way, we find that the fundamental energy is 3*k_B*T (6 d.o.f.).
 
We use a foundational temperature, consistent with the anthropic principle [2], of the freezing
point (and melting point) of the essential object for existence--water. Using this temperature,
we obtain a fundamental energy of ~70.6 meV,
 

[1] Calculation is as follows:
 
3 * 8.62E-05 eV/K * 273.15 K = 70.614 meV

and then convert this into a frequency
70.614 meV/ (hbar * pi^4) = 1.1 THz



Note that the \pi^4 in general is \pi^D, where D is the number of spacetime
dimensions in existence.

Lighthouse Frequency calculated to be approx. 1,101,361,642,963.57 Hz 
 
[2]  The  anthropic  principle  states  that  observations  of  our  physical  universe
should be compatible with the life (us) that observes it.

 

Figure 2.   Sine wave of our Blinking Universe.

Conclusions
 
This technical note has described an alternate mathematical approach for determining the
blinking frequency of our universe. Comments and suggestions are welcome to the email
address below.
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Figure 3.  Comparison of Earth-Shattering Ideas.  Lighthouse vs. DaVinci vs. Einstein



Figure 4.  A blinking universe gives rise to 1024 Elementary Particles.  64 particle masses X 4
charges X 4 spins.
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My entire collection of ebooks were deleted from Smashwords.com in January 2020, because
kevin@smashwords.com claims he did not like my “intentions.”  He fully admits that I did not 
violate their Terms of Service, an issue of which they initially accused me.  From 2013 thru 
2019, I distributed more than 21,000 ebooks from a smashwords account.  Most of them were
free.

I am a proud government whistleblower – see my ebooks about the criminal acts of the CIA 
and FBI. Readers are advised that the CIA may be blocking or restricting access to some of 
my ebooks, especially outside the United States. Readers are further advised that digital 
tracking tags may have been placed in my ebooks.  The content of some ebooks may have 
been altered – still trying to monitor this.  If you have tried to contact me, it is possible that 
emails and phone calls are being blocked.

Readers are advised to review the website DrJudyWood.com which provides compelling 
evidence about 9-11. 
http://drJudyWood.com/articles/DEW/StarWarsBeam4.html

Note Figure 63. Dr Wood spent many years researching this and filed suit against the US 
Government, along with Dr Morgan Reynolds. Jet fuel does not burn through concrete and 
steel. The cookie-cutter holes were made by a high-powered laser that rapidly ages material -
and turned the concrete and steel into dust in seconds. Note Figure 38(a) here:
http://drJudyWood.com/articles/DEW/StarWarsBeam3.html

This laser operates at a harmonic of the blinking frequency - which causes rapid aging. 
Readers are also advised to see the movie "Unacknowledged" by Dr Steven Greer, M.D., and
to watch the youtube videos by the Honorable Paul Hellyer, former Canadian Minister of 
Defense.  He has a book titled, “The Money Mafia.”

For more than 10 years, this author has been stalked, harassed, and threatened by US 
Government agents from the CIA, FBI, and NSA - because of the content of my ebooks. My 
home has been broken into, repeatedly. In May 2014, my girlfriend was drugged and 
kidnapped from LaGuardia airport. This is not a joke. My computer, phone, and alarm system 
have been hacked, including those of my friends and family. It is truly sad and pathetic, these 
government agencies have become criminal organizations, under the Deep State. If 
something happens to me (disappearance, false criminal charges, sudden accident, etc. - my 
readers can be certain that the FBI and CIA were involved. I am not depressed, I do not own 
a gun, and I have never been suicidal – this needs to be stated because the CIA continues to 
arrange murders, and stage it as a suicide.  See my related ebooks identifying the murders of
Gary Webb, Michael Hastings, Phil Schneider, William Colby, Dr Eugene Mallove, Stan 



Meyers, Phil Haney, and others.  In my opinion, the CIA and Council on Foreign Relations 
(CFR) are behind these criminal acts; David Rockefeller was the CEO and Chairman for 
many years.
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